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DOUGLAS P. MCCORMACK

Vice Chairman

Doug McCormack has spent the past 25 years 
engaged at the intersection of health care policy, law, 
politics and business.  He specializes in solving com-
plex challenges at the federal level through creative 
solutions and tenacious advocacy.  Mr. McCormack 
returns to providing professional services after a 
decade of corporate health care experience.

For the past ten years, Mr. McCormack has been 
founder, CEO and Chairman of two venture-backed 
technology companies in the medical device and 
digital health sectors.  Under his leadership, these 
companies amassed nearly two dozen patents, were 
recognized with multiple R&D 100 and Edison Awards 
for innovation, and partnered with Apple to feature 
the first medical device brought to market with patient 
connectivity and control via an iPhone app.  Mr. 
McCormack exited his first business through a strate-
gic asset sale to a global market leader based in 
Germany.

Prior to his entrepreneurial career, Doug spent 
fifteen years in health policy and advocacy, including 
as a lawyer in a top DC-based law firm, and then as a 
partner in a global law firm where he was a 
co-founder of that firm’s public policy and advocacy 
practice group.  In this capacity, he focused on 
representing before Congress and federal agencies a 
range of health care interests, including hospitals 
and health systems, hospital consortia, physician 
and specialty practice groups, trade associations, 
group purchasing organizations, and medical tech-
nology companies.

Doug received his undergraduate degree from the 
University of Southern California and his Juris 
Doctorate from American University’s Washington 
College of Law.   He is a member of the Maryland 
and District of Columbia bars, and serves on the 
boards of several early-stage technology companies.


